

QUALITY SINGLE ACCOUNTABILITY CONTINUUM (QSAC)

*18. RESOLVED, that the Roxbury Township Board of Education accept the placement results of the Quality Single Accountability Continuum (QSAC) for the 2016/2017 school year.

Instruction & Program	83%	Operations	100%
Fiscal Management	96%	Personnel	100%
Governance	98%		

AWARD OF BID

*19. A Notice for sealed proposals for Printing (Preprinted Forms & Stationery) was advertised using Ed-Data in accordance with the provisions of the Public Contracts Law N.J.S.A. 18A:18A-21. Proposals were received, opened and read publicly at 11:00 a.m. on Tuesday, June 20, 2017, by the School Business Administrator at the Board of Education Office, 42 North Hillside Avenue, Succasunna, New Jersey.

RESOLVED, that the Roxbury Township Board of Education award the Printing (Preprinted Forms & Stationery) proposal to the low bidder per item as listed below..

Item Description	Ridgewood Press 609 Franklin Turnpike Ridgewood, NJ 07450	Price Rite Business Forms 389 Summerhill Drive Morris Plains, NJ 07950
Tickets, Graduation Tickets	\$0.12*	No bid
Graduation Programs	\$0.90*	No bid
Charge Sheets	\$0.12	\$0.11*
Check Request, Student Activities Check Request	\$0.12*	\$0.13
Student Activities Deposit Slip	\$0.12*	\$0.13
Business Window Envelope - #10 Window Roxbury High School Return Address	\$0.04*	\$0.05
Business Envelope - #10 Roxbury High School Return Address	\$0.03*	\$0.03*
Roxbury District Athletic Emergency Information	\$0.16*	\$0.16*
School Physician's Notification of Sports Participation	\$0.09*	\$0.10
Emergency Cards for Students	\$0.04*	\$0.08
Emergency Card for Staff	\$0.15*	\$0.21
Emergency Card for Preschool	\$0.18*	\$0.40
Permanent Record Folders	\$0.33*	No bid
Secondary School Test Record	\$0.07*	\$0.13
School Profile	\$2.40*	No bid
Program of Studies	\$7.80*	No bid
From the Desk of	\$4.00*	\$7.50
Business Cards	\$0.13	\$0.11*
*indicates low bid for item		